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In response to suggestions that local governments employ eminent domain authority to restructure 
mortgage obligations, the Federal Housing Finance Agency (FHFA) published a Notice in the 
Federal Register entitled "Use of Eminent Domain to Restructure Performing Loans," 77 Federal 
Register 47652 (August 9, 2012). 

At that time, FHFA indicated it had significant concerns about the use of eminent domain to revise 
existing financial contracts and the resulting alteration of value of securities holdings of Fannie Mae 
and Freddie Mac and the twelve Federal Home Loan Banks. Additionally, FHFA noted it would 
review certain questions regarding such usage of eminent domain and would accept public input. 
This memorandum provides a review of the topic, input received and implications for FHFA. 1 

General 

A proposal for local government use of eminent domain authority to restructure mortgages has 
generated much discussion both from the points of legality of such an action to the implementation 
of such a proposal and its impact on institutions under Federal Housing Finance Agency oversight 
and the broad securities market that supports housing finance. 

Input received came from individuals in government, private sector financial institutions, labor 
unions, businesses and academics as well as interest groups for homeowners and from businesses 
involved in financial markets. Seventy-five submissions were made, almost evenly divided between 
supporters and opponents.2 The general thrust of input from the public fell into two categories— 
those supporting the use of eminent domain for restructuring loans as falling within the purview of 
localities and as an effective device to assist homeowners and those opposing such use of eminent 
domain as violating law, eroding the value of existing financial obligations and de-stabilizing the 
market that supports housing finance. 

T h i s paper provides a summary o f eminent domain issues, including legal issues, but is not intended to serve as a 

formal legal opinion. 

2 

Submissions may be found at 
ht tp: / ' 'ww.mfa .gov/ 'Defaul t .as^ 

http://www.fhfa.gov/SupervisionRegulation/Rules/Pages/Comment-List.aspx?RuleID=357 (new FHFA website as of 4/2014)

http://www.fhfa.gov/SupervisionRegulation/Rules/Pages/Comment-List.aspx?RuleID=357
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Supporters advocated that, i f securities have lost value, then the proper and fair valuation of 
mortgages backing the securities through eminent domain results in no loss to a securities investor, 
but permits a restmcturing of a loan that would benefit homeowners and stabilize housing values. 

Supporters advocated that FHFA had no role to play in a local or state action, as many local actions 
affect housing markets and are entrusted to state and local officials by law. These supporters 
advanced that assisting underwater borrowers who are paying their mortgage obligations justifies the 
use of eminent domain to adjust their mortgages to a more affordable obligation which they could 
not otherwise receive.3 Several supporters argued that use of eminent domain would be a form of 
principal forgiveness that would benefit homeowners. 

Opponents advocated numerous legal problems with the proposed use of eminent domain; some 
centered on the proper use of eminent domain itself and others on attendant constitutional issues 
related to taking of property or sanctity of contract. Opponents noted strong reaction of financial 
markets that support home financing in terms of upsetting existing contracts but as well creating an 
unworkable situation for providing and pricing capital based on the uncertainty of such a use of 
eminent domain. 

Eminent Domain 

Eminent domain, also referred to in operation as a condemnation, involves a state action to seize 
property founded on a public purpose and for which fair value is paid to the person or entity whose 
property is seized. Eminent domain authority resides with the states; states enact laws permitting 
local governments to exercise eminent domain and local laws may vary on conditions, terms and 
methods for acting on this authority so long as the ordinances do not permit conduct contrary to 
enabling state law. At the same time, constitutional provisions relating to the sanctity of contracts, 
due process, "takings" prohibitions and interstate commerce provide a nexus for federal review. 

The Supreme Court in 2005 upheld an eminent domain transfer of real property from one private 
party to another; many states reacted to this by enacting laws that denied local governments the 
authority to undertake such transfers, in order to focus the exercise of eminent domain more clearly 
on a public purpose.4 While eminent domain has been viewed as predominately related to taking of 

I f accepted that eminent domain may be employed to seize performing loans, then it might be argued that eminent 

domain could be employed to seize non-performing loans as well. 

4 
K e l o v. City o f N e w L o n d o n , 545 U . S . 469 (2005). I n Kelo, the transfer o f real property, effected by the use o f eminent 

domain from one private party to another, was supported by the Court as part o f a comprehensive plan by the city 

similar to urban planning and development for multiple properties. Here , the taking was o f real estate, not contract 

rights, and involved a wide ranging plan for redeveloping real property. Further the Court noted that a public purpose 

must exist even i f the taking included just compensation to the property owner. I n reaction to KBIO, the enactment o f the 

Housing and E c o n o m i c Recovery A c t in 2008, P L 110-289 (2008), provided congressional views regarding the use of 

eminent domain relating to use o f funds for certain affordable housing programs. A t section 1337(g)(12 U S C 456 7 (g)) , 

Congress indicated that no funds allocated to affordable housing programs at the Department o f Housing and U r b a n 

Development or the Treasury Department could be used "in conjunction with property taken by eminent domain, unless 

eminent domain is employed only for a public use, except that for purposes o f this section, public use shall not be 

construed to include economic development that primarily benefits any private entity." 



Page 3 

teal property, such as to support road, airport or infrastructure construction by a locality, it has been 
employed in verjr limited circumstances with intangible property. In some cases, the intangible 
property, such as goodwill, has been compensated attendant to a taking of business's real property. 
On balance, use of eminent domain for addressing contractual rights or intangible rights has been 
rare. 

Supporters for a use of eminent domain to restructure performing mortgage loans indicate that it is 
a right of localities to employ this approach, that such a program helps investors by avoiding 
strategic defaults by performing, but underwater borrowers, that the program would benefit local 
communities by avoiding defaults and that states have inherent rights to act without federal 
intervention. To date, no community has implemented fully such a program and supporters have 
indicated that they would modify their proposals to address some concerns that have been raised. 

Issues for the Federal Housing Finance Agency 

From the perspective of the Federal Housing Finance Agency, acting as Conservator for Fannie Mae 
and Freddie Mac (Enterprises) and regulator for the Federal Home Loan Banks, the use of eminent 
domain for altering contractual arrangements raises several core issues— the conflict of federal and 
state interests; assuming that a legitimate state interest may exist, the legality of such a plan; 
operation of such a plan and its impact on mortgage markets; safety and soundness concerns; 
valuation matters; and, creation of losses to the conservatorships. 

Federal Interest 

Where a federal interest exists and is established, that interest would preempt a conflicting state 
interest. Here, the interest of the Conservator to preserve and conserve assets and to operate the 
Enterprises in conservatorships would be superior to the interest of a locality to alter the terms of a 
contract held by the Enterprises either through their ownership of a mortgage-backed security, their 
guarantee of a pool of mortgages or their ownership of a mortgage held in portfolio. As regulator 
for the Home Loan Banks, entrusted with safety and soundness responsibilities by federal law, 
concern would exist for any de-stabilization of investments held by the Banks as well as for values 
for collateral pledged to secure advances. 

For the Enterprises, only the Conservator is empowered to alter contracts and state action to affect 
the assets held by the Enterprises in conservatorships would run contrary to the Housing and 
Economic Recovery Act provisions on conservatorship that bar actions by federal or state actors 
that would interfere with conservatorship operations.5 

Harm to a conservatorship, through losses to the Enterprises, would result from a third party acting 
under eminent domain to remove a performing loan from a pool, thereby reducing the value of the 

12 U S C 4617 (a)(7) Initial reports o f eminent domain programs purported to exclude Fannie Mae and Freddie Mac 

mortgages in any securities from which loans are removed for the time being, possibly to avoid statutory prohibitions. 

A s noted this does not address investments in securities held by the Enterprises. Further, eminent domain may address 

not only mortgages in securities, but as well could be employed to address any mortgage loan including those held in 

lender portfolios. 
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asset of the Enterprise and the loss of a stream of income. As well, any program that affects loans 
held in securities might be argued to be available to modify loans held in portfolio by a regulated 
entity, which also raises concerns. It may be noted that the harm involved in eminent domain 
takings includes not only the removal of a performing loan through a discounted acquisition price, 
but also the extraction of value by a locality or its designee for administrative or other expenses. 
Finally, the estimation of fair value is frequently the subject of significant litigation and involves 
complex matters including benchmarks and value of a performing asset. Involvement in such 
litigation and other legal costs further increase losses for an Enterprise operating in conservatorship 
or a Home Loan Bank. 

legality of Use of Eminent Domain to Restructure Mortgage Contracts 

Assuming that a valid state interest exists, one that is not preempted by federal interests, the legality 
of such use of eminent domain remains in doubt. Indeed, supporters of an eminent domain 
program anticipate and have communicated that they anticipate significant legal action regarding all 
aspects of the use of eminent domain to restructure contracts in existing pools of mortgages. 

Legal questions fall into several categories. 

First, it is questioned whether the exercise of eminent domain for intangible assets fits within state 
laws authorizing eminent domain by localities. This may not exist in certain states and present a 
conflict for a locality. 

Second, it is questioned whether the exercise of eminent domain in such a manner as discussed by 
certain localities violates certain constitutional provisions. These questions center on an improper 
"taking" under the Fifth Amendment as to public purpose as noted above; an improper taking as 
the intangible asset is performing and creates no threat to the community; a taking of a performing 
asset when no assurance exists that the asset would cease performing (a predictive action); a 
violation of the Contracts Clause of the Constitution that prohibits impairing the obligations of a 
contract, including debt contracts such as a mortgage; and, finally, since mortgage backed securities 
are traded domestically and internationally, the action of a state could be seen as a violation of the 
Commerce Clause which requires states not to interfere with interstate commerce except where 
there is a legitimate state interest, the state has chosen the least burdensome means of promoting 
that interest and the interest outweighs the burden on interstate commerce. 

Third, employment of eminent domain in the area of housing contracts for underwater borrowers 
could target only certain areas of a community and lead to questions regarding redlining and fair 
housing laws. 

Fourth, challenges may exist to a local jurisdiction's action operating under state laws. 
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Operation of Such a Plan 

There has been much discussion of the operation and impact of eminent domain for revising 
mortgage contracts and impact on mortgage markets. Among core concerns have been— 

First, such a program •will encounter difficulty in determining values for performing loans as there 
are too many variables either with static or dynamic modeling to accurately measure the full value of 
a mortgage, including its stream of income. 

Second, even i f an economic valuation could be approximated on the mortgage contract, such a 
program cannot operate without extracting value to locahties and consulting firms. In short, fees to 
localities and consulting firms would be part of any analysis of the ultimate costs of the program to 
the investor or lender. 

Third, such a program would create fundamental uncertainties. With over 60,000 municipalities, the 
implementation would be anticipated as being very uneven and problematic for national lending 
programs. Which loans are selected, under what criteria and how valuations would be undertaken, 
all would generate uncertainties with multiple approaches and multiple legal actions. 

Fourth, such a program does not provide a national uniform structure as does HAMP or HARP, but 
rather creates a program implemented on an ad hoc basis, presenting different risk factors in 
different markets. No supervision or oversight is envisioned in local eminent domain decisions, 
absent action by a state regulator or by a court. 

Fifth, such a program could be counter-productive and difficult to assess. In a market where home 
values are stabilizing and, in some cases, moving upwards, the need for such a program (even i f it 
were merited) appears to diminish, the effect of such a program could be to depress artificially the 
value of homes and lower the tax base for communities and chill lending to support a rising market. 
The uncertainties of an eminent domain loan restmcttiring program as well as the predictable results 
lead to a concern for market reaction adverse to housing finance. 

Finally, adverse reactions to such a program could dramatically alter the business model for lending. 
I f investors and lenders see increased uncertainty, two routine results would be anticipated— 
limitation on lending and on investing in certain markets and higher costs to address uncertainties. 

Safety and Soundness Concerns and Conservatorship Interests 

There are significant safety and soundness concerns, some aligned with the market effects noted 
above. 

First, no program oversight exists. Local programs would be administered by a mixture of local 
governments, external consulting firms and the judiciary. This would produce uncertainly and 
unreliability for a system that today relies on contracts between parties with relatively clear federal 
and state laws. Use of eminent domain for this purpose would represent a move to a new form of 
action, without established methodologies or predictable dispute resolution vehicles. Thus, this use 
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of eminent domain would be fundamentally different from its current usage for condemnation of 
homes and other real properties. 

Second, Hability for program deficiencies remains uncertain. Consulting firms operating as limited 
hability companies and localities attempting to shield themselves from hability through special 
purpose government structures provide no clarity as to who would be responsible and with what 
resources to meet legal costs and potential damages from law violation and related litigation. 

Third, operation of such a program to select a group of loans for a purported benefit would present 
potential claims that do not exist with current programs for restxuctxiring loans by the contracting 
parties themselves. Existing programs for loan modifications create engibility standards for 
modifications that follow initial borrower evaluations, have modification guidelines and occur under 
federal regulation or oversight. As noted above, use of eminent domain has been challenged for 
potential violations of the Fair Housing Act and, as a new device, could be subject to additional 
charges of discrimination or consumer protection violations. 

Fourth, the value of loans to all FHFA regulated entities would be called into question. Existing 
mortgage portfolios, existing pledged collateral for advances, investments in private label securities 
(PLS) and Ikbility for securitized mortgage pools would all come under scrutiny and potential 
valuation changes or downgrading. 

Fifth, eminent domain for restructuring mortgages could run contrary to the conservatorships which 
prohibit states from mterfering with the operation of FHFA. 6 Pulling performing loans out of PLS 
by a state or state-authorized body could remove FHFA discretion to maintain the value of PLS and 
not to have investments under its control affected by state action. 

Sixth, there is uncertain precedent with the extent of state action. When would such a program 
stop— when individuals are 30%, 20% or 10% underwater. Also, would such a program be 
expanded to other types of mortgage obligations including modified loans, home equity loans and 
other housing-related financings based on the determinations of a locality. 

See County o f Sonoma v. Federal Housing Finance Agency, 710 F . 3 d 987 (9 t h Cir . 2013). Conservator direction to 

Enterprises not to purchase mortgages encumbered by county loans issued as tax assessments upheld. T h e Circuit Court 

noted, " A decision not to buy assets that F H F A deems risky is within its conservator power to 'carry on' the Enterprises' 

business and to 'preserve and conserve the assets and property o f the [Enterprises].' 12 U . S . C . § 4617(b)(2)(D)(ii)." A s 

well, the Court noted, " W h e n F H F A decides not to purchase a class o f mortgages that it believes pose excessive risk, it 

is attempting to preserve and conserve the Enterprises' assets and property. Indeed, careful management o f its mortgage 

purchase decisions appears to be the only way F H F A can avoid the financial problems which precipitated the 

Enterprises' conservatorship. Although F H F A ' s powers as conservator are not limidess, the ability to decide which 

mortgages to buy is an inherent component o f F H F A ' s charge to preserve and conserve the Enterprises' assets. See Leon 

Cniy., 700 F . 3 d at 1279 ("It is fully within the responsibilities o f a protective conservator, acting as a prudent business 

manager, to decline to purchase a mortgage when its lien will be relegated to an inferior position for payment.")." 
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Valuation Concerns 

All laws and court cases relating to eminent domain require a payment of "just compensation." This 
turns on the valuation of the property and is frequently the crux of legal dispute; such disputes can 
be expensive, long lasting and produce a "chill" on financial markets. In the case of a performing 
mortgage, the value of the mortgage is a mixture of the unpaid balance and the income stream from 
that mortgage. Clearly, for an intangible asset, the value of the property is only a part of a 
calculation; there is a great concern with the value of the contract, particularly a performing contract. 

First, valuations must be made on a case-by-case basis for each property. Attempts to advocate a 
pool-based approach do not work. Pulling an individual loan out of a pool requires analysis that is 
undertaken today in HAMP about individual assets and ability to pay, along with other measures 
that do not appear to exist for an eminent domain program. An argument that Enterprise pool level 
analytics for PLS loans and securities disclosures would suffice is misplaced; such reports are pool 
level reports based on analytics that do involve some review of individual loans, but do not replace 
in an eminent domain proceeding, the need for individual valuation, particularly where a loan is 
performing. Nor can the GSE calculations be reverse engineered for an individual loan. Further, 
the process might include a calculation of likelihood to default, noted above as difficult i f market 
values are rising. 

Second, what analysis is employed on valuation under various local programs remains uncertain 
both as to methods and as to expertise brought to bear. 

Third, valuation itself could generate claims of discrimination and legal challenges as noted above. 

Conclusion and Potential Actions 

On balance, after conducting a review of law and markets and considering public input, there is a 
rational basis to conclude that the use of eminent domain by locahties to restructure loans for 
borrowers that are "underwater" on their mortgages presents a clear threat to the safe and sound 
operations of Fannie Mae, Freddie Mac and the Federal Home Loan Banks as provided in federal 
law, would run contrary to the goals set forth by Congress for the operation of conservatorships by 
FHFA and presents a direct relationship to FHFA's responsibility for overseeing entities that deal in 
"federally related mortgage loan[s]" as defined at 12 USC 2602. 

FHFA has a broad range of authorities both as a regulator and as a conservator that could be 
deployed to respond to the findings made here regarding the risks posed by eminent domain. In 
making a determination on an appropriate course, the Agency would consider carefully and fully the 
context of an action or planned action by a locality and the impact on FHFA's regulated entities. 

Alfred M. Pollard 
General Counsel 




